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Woody Guthrie with guitar labeled "This Machine Kills Fascists" (1943) Background information Birth
name Woodrow Wilson Guthrie Born July 14, 1912 Okemah, Oklahoma, United States Died October 3,
1967 (aged 55) New York City, New York, United States Genres Folk, protest song Occupations Singer-
songwriter Instruments Vocals, guitar, harmonica, mandolin, fiddle Years active 1930-1956 Associated acts
Almanac Singers Notable instruments Martin 000-18, Gibson Southern Jumbo, Gibson J-45 Woodrow
Wilson "Woody" Guthrie (July 14, 1912 - October 3, 1967) was an American singer-songwriter and folk
musician whose musical legacy includes hundreds of political, traditional and children's songs, ballads and
improvised works. He frequently performed with the slogan This Machine Kills Fascists displayed on his
guitar. His best-known song is "This Land Is Your Land." Many of his recorded songs are archived in the
Library of Congress.[1] Such songwriters as Bob Dylan, Phil Ochs, Bruce Springsteen, John Mellencamp,
Pete Seeger, Joe Strummer, Billy Bragg, Jeff Tweedy and Tom Paxton have acknowledged Guthrie as a
major influence. Many of his songs are about his experiences in the Dust Bowl era during the Great
Depression when Guthrie traveled with migrant workers from Oklahoma to California and learned their
traditional folk and blues songs, earning him the nickname the "Dust Bowl Troubadour."[2] Throughout his
life Guthrie was associated with United States Communist groups, though he was seemingly not a member of
any.[3] Guthrie was married three times and fathered eight children, including American folk musician Arlo
Guthrie. Guthrie died from complications of Huntington's disease, a progressive genetic neurological
disorder. During his later years, in spite of his illness, Guthrie served as a figurehead in the folk movement,
providing inspiration to a generation of new folk musicians, including mentor relationships with Ramblin'
Jack Elliott and Bob Dylan.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Roberts:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Woody Guthrie : a life / Joe Klein. You can choose the best
book if you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a new book Woody Guthrie : a
life / Joe Klein. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely
right, due to the fact from book you can understand everything! From your country right up until foreign or
abroad you will end up known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era,
you can open a book or maybe searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you
feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Elizabeth Ramsey:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title Woody Guthrie :
a life / Joe Klein suitable to you? Often the book was written by renowned writer in this era. The book
untitled Woody Guthrie : a life / Joe Kleinis one of several books which everyone read now. That book was
inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new shape that you ever
know before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to be aware of
the core of this guide. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you
to see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Jerry Blair:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can read
the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a e-book. The book Woody Guthrie : a life / Joe Klein it is rather good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough
space to bring this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from a
smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers high quality.

Joseph Lafond:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Woody Guthrie : a life / Joe Klein book
written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that can be understand by anyone who
have read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and composing skill
only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Woody Guthrie : a life / Joe Klein as
good book not simply by the cover but also by the content. This is one publication that can break don't assess
book by its cover, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your
reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.
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