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In the Beginning, James.

Orphaned, bullied, lonely, and unloved as a boy, in time the young King of Scots overcame his troubled
beginnings to ascend the English throne at the height of England’s Golden Age. In an effort to pacify rising
tensions in the Anglican Church, and to reflect the majesty of his new reign, he spearheaded the most
important literary undertaking in Western history?the translation of the Bible into a beautiful, lyrical, and
accessible English.

David Teems’s narrative crackles with wit, using a thoroughly modern tongue to reanimate the life of this
seventeenth century king?a man at the intersection of political, literary, and religious thought, yet a man of
contrasts, dubbed by one French king as “the wisest fool in Christendom.”

Warm, insightful, even at times amusing, Teems’s depiction of King James has all the elements of a grand
tale?conspiracy, kidnapping, witchcraft, murder, love, despair, loss. Majestie offers an engaging new look at
the world’s most cherished, revered, and influential translation of Sacred Writ and the king behind it.

 “Engrossing and entertaining…a delightful read in every way.” – Publishers Weekly
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From reader reviews:

Bradley Sparks:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by means
of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is high. For
you personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that Majestie: The King Behind the
King James Bible book as basic and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more than just a
book.

Keven Peterson:

The actual book Majestie: The King Behind the King James Bible will bring you to the new experience of
reading a book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to see,
this book very ideal to you. The book Majestie: The King Behind the King James Bible is much
recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read
the book.

Charlie Attwood:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, brief story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Majestie: The King Behind the King
James Bible that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading habit
all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world much better then how they react to the
world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants
to become success person. So , for every you who want to start looking at as your good habit, it is possible to
pick Majestie: The King Behind the King James Bible become your starter.

Edward White:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book Majestie: The King Behind the King James Bible was
colorful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Majestie: The King Behind the King
James Bible has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan
you can read and believe that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you
bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to
like reading which.
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