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“Vivid and moving. . . . [Tells] a story all but lost in most civil rights histories.”?Bill Marvel, Dallas
Morning News

It was the final speech of a long day, August 28, 1963, when hundreds of thousands gathered on the Mall for
the March on Washington for Jobs and Freedom. In a resounding cadence, Martin Luther King Jr. lifted the
crowd when he told of his dream that all Americans would join together to realize the founding ideal of
equality. The power of the speech created an enduring symbol of the march and the larger civil rights
movement. King’s speech still inspires us fifty years later, but its very power has also narrowed our
understanding of the march. In this insightful history, William P. Jones restores the march to its full
significance.

The opening speech of the day was delivered by the leader of the march, the great trade unionist A. Philip
Randolph, who first called for a march on Washington in 1941 to press for equal opportunity in employment
and the armed forces. To the crowd that stretched more than a mile before him, Randolph called for an end to
segregation and a living wage for every American. Equal access to accommodations and services would
mean little to people, white and black, who could not afford them. Randolph’s egalitarian vision of economic
and social citizenship is the strong thread running through the full history of the March on Washington
Movement. It was a movement of sustained grassroots organizing, linked locally to women’s groups, unions,
and churches across the country. Jones’s fresh, compelling history delivers a new understanding of this
emblematic event and the broader civil rights movement it propelled.
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From reader reviews:

Jo Daigneault:

The experience that you get from The March on Washington: Jobs, Freedom, and the Forgotten History of
Civil Rights is a more deep you digging the information that hide within the words the more you get serious
about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand but The March on Washington: Jobs,
Freedom, and the Forgotten History of Civil Rights giving you excitement feeling of reading. The author
conveys their point in certain way that can be understood through anyone who read the item because the
author of this reserve is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase
well. That makes it easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We highly recommend you for having this The March on Washington: Jobs, Freedom, and the
Forgotten History of Civil Rights instantly.

Brooke Callender:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you buy it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The March on Washington: Jobs, Freedom, and the
Forgotten History of Civil Rights as the daily resource information.

Denise Zimmerman:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving The March on Washington:
Jobs, Freedom, and the Forgotten History of Civil Rights that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied
through reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the means for people to know
world better then how they react toward the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading practice only
for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you
who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick The March on Washington: Jobs, Freedom, and
the Forgotten History of Civil Rights become your current starter.

Colleen Williams:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many
books in the top checklist in your reading list is definitely The March on Washington: Jobs, Freedom, and
the Forgotten History of Civil Rights. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you



closer in growing to be precious person. By looking up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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