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One of the foremost courtroom lawyers of his generation. Alan M. Dershowitz takes controversial stands
based on the principle of equal justice for all. Along the way, he has authored the #1 New York Times
bestseller Chutzpah; the bestselling account of the Claus von Bulow case Reversal of Fortune; and the
bestselling courtroom drama The Advocate's Devil. Now Dershowitz has written a novel that is at once
personal, passionate, and towering: an explosive legal thriller that pits Dershowitz's literary alter ego,
attorney Abe Ringel, against the worst crime of the twentieth century -- the Holocaust.

What if you witnessed the most abominable deeds that human beings can inflict upon each other? What if
you came face-to-face with the very man who had slaughtered your family before your eyes? That is the
question confronted by a celebrated professor named Max Menuchen. Max has found the man who had
killed his entire family in cold blood more than a half century before. Max, who has never before broken a
law, cannot turn down his chance for revenge.

In 1943 Marcellus Prandus was a Lithuanian militia captain who carried out the blood-thirsty orders of his
Nazi commanders during World War II. Today he is an old man living outside Boston. For Max, who has
discovered Prandus's identity by chance, killing him is not enough, because Prandus is already dying of
cancer. How can Max make Prandus suffer exactly as Max himself did? Can Max bring himself to
assassinate Prandus's children and grandchildren and make the old man watch his family die, as Max himself
was forced to do?

By the time defense attorney Abe Ringel enters the case, Max has carried out an astounding act of revenge,
and America'sgreat Holocaust trial has begun: an explosive legal and moral struggle to find the light of
justice within the darkness of human evil. With Max facing almost certain conviction, Ringel desperately
tries to prove his actions we
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From reader reviews:

Jack Young:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great and also important the book Just Revenge. All type of
book are you able to see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Rosemary Taylor:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important for people. The book Just Revenge seemed to be making you to
know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for
you. The guide Just Revenge is not only giving you considerably more new information but also to be your
friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your reserve. Try to make
relationship while using book Just Revenge. You never truly feel lose out for everything should you read
some books.

Kenneth Hill:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading routine
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you
want experience happy read one with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The particular Just
Revenge is kind of book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Doris Avey:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Just Revenge
suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era. The particular book untitled Just
Revengeis one of several books this everyone read now. This book was inspired lots of people in the world.
When you read this e-book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know just before. The
author explained their plan in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this
publication. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world in this particular book.
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