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Barbara Park’s New York Times bestselling chapter book series, Junie B. Jones, is a classroom favorite
and has been keeping kids laughing—and reading—for more than twenty years. Over 60 million
copies in print and now with a bright new look for a new generation!
 
Meet the World’s Funniest Kindergartner—Junie B. Jones! Junie B. wants to be a beauty shop guy when she
grows up. But first she needs a little practice. And a few volunteers. Like her bunny slippers. And her dog.
And maybe even . . . herself? Is Junie B. on her way to a great new career? Or is she about to have the worst
hair day ever?
 
USA Today:
“Junie B. is the darling of the young-reader set.”
 
Publishers Weekly:
“Park convinces beginning readers that Junie B.—and reading—are lots of fun.”
 
Kirkus Reviews:
“Junie’s swarms of young fans will continue to delight in her unique take on the world. . . . A hilarious, first-
rate read-aloud.”
 
Time:
“Junie B. Jones is a feisty six-year-old with an endearing penchant for honesty.”

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Cooke:

Book is written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A reserve Junie B. Jones #11: Junie B. Jones Is a
Beauty Shop Guy will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you
can know about everything. But some of you think that open or reading some sort of book make you bored.
It is not make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or appropriate
book with you?

Darlene Johnson:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of
book you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience happy
read one using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The particular Junie B. Jones #11: Junie B. Jones
Is a Beauty Shop Guy is kind of publication which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Alfred Leahy:

Beside this particular Junie B. Jones #11: Junie B. Jones Is a Beauty Shop Guy in your phone, it may give
you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you may got here
is fresh in the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow community. It
is good thing to have Junie B. Jones #11: Junie B. Jones Is a Beauty Shop Guy because this book offers to
your account readable information. Do you often have book but you would not get what it's exactly about.
Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be
questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book as
well as read it from currently!

Christina Bales:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world.
From the book Junie B. Jones #11: Junie B. Jones Is a Beauty Shop Guy we can consider more advantage.
Don't one to be creative people? To become creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the
best book that suited with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book Junie B.
Jones #11: Junie B. Jones Is a Beauty Shop Guy. You can more attractive than now.
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