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A fresh, innovative, and streamlined approach to the LSAT, featuring techniques geared towards students
aiming for top scores. Now with more practice problems and new online resources!

Offering a streamlined and innovative approach to the LSAT, the Manhattan Prep Set of 3 LSAT Strategy
Guides are true course materials. Created and field-tested by Manhattan Prepâ€™s expert instructors, they
are a must-have resource for any student preparing to take the exam. Included in this all-in-one set are books
devoted to the testâ€™s three sections: Logical Reasoning, Reading Comprehension, and Logic Games.
Beginning with how to recognize each and every game type, the Logic Games LSAT Strategy Guide
(9781937707743) takes you through the entire solving process. You will learn strategies for making
inferences, techniques for accurate diagramming, and tools for improving your time management. Each
chapter is designed to encourage mastery with timed drill sets that use real LSAT logic game questions and
provide in-depth explanations, including hand-drawn diagrams and notes from Manhattan Prepâ€™s expert
instructors.Avoiding an unwieldy and ineffective focus on memorizing sub-categories and steps, the Logical
Reasoning LSAT Strategy Guide (9781937707750) encourages a streamlined method that engages and
improves your natural critical-thinking skills. Beginning with an effective approach to reading arguments
and identifying answers, this book trains you to see through the clutter and recognize the core of an
argument. It also arms you with the tools needed to pick apart the answer choices, offering in-depth
explanations for every single answer â€“ both correct and incorrect â€“ leading to a complex understanding
of this subtle section. The Reading Comprehension LSAT Strategy Guide (9781937707767) teaches you
how to recognize the core argument and then use it as a framework on which to organize the entire passage,
improving the speed and clarity with which you read. To further improve your reading, it walks you through
the process of annotation, discussing where and how to take notes in order to maximize your comprehension
without eating up precious time. It also looks at what types of questions the LSAT asks and then arms you
with the skills you need to spot issues and identify correct answers.Further practice sets and other additional
resources are included online and can be accessed through the Manhattan Prep website. Resources include
online access to class recordings, online learning labs, and a downloadable study guide and progress-tracking
tool.
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From reader reviews:

Celina Ziolkowski:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get lots of stress
from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely yes. People is
human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are there when the spare time
coming to you of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one, reading guides. It can be
your alternative in spending your spare time, the book you have read is LSAT Strategy Guides (Logic Games
/ Logical Reasoning / Reading Comprehension), 4th Edition.

Alan Trevino:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this LSAT Strategy Guides (Logic
Games / Logical Reasoning / Reading Comprehension), 4th Edition guide written by well-known writer we
are excited for well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written
throughout good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your
personal hunger then you still skepticism LSAT Strategy Guides (Logic Games / Logical Reasoning /
Reading Comprehension), 4th Edition as good book not simply by the cover but also with the content. This is
one publication that can break don't ascertain book by its include, so do you still needing an additional sixth
sense to pick this!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to
another sixth sense.

Toby Lowry:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This LSAT Strategy Guides (Logic
Games / Logical Reasoning / Reading Comprehension), 4th Edition is simple to develop you can read it in
the playground, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the actual printed book,
you can buy often the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the book in your smart
phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Pauline Browne:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just spending
your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the books in the top
checklist in your reading list is definitely LSAT Strategy Guides (Logic Games / Logical Reasoning /
Reading Comprehension), 4th Edition. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer
in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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