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On February 17, 2008, Kosovo declared its independence, becoming the seventh state to emerge from the
break-up of the former Yugoslavia. A tiny country of just two million people, 90% of whom are ethnic
Albanians, Kosovo is central-geographically, historically, and politically-to the future of the Western
Balkans and, in turn, its potential future within the European Union. But the fate of both Kosovo, condemned
by Serbian leaders as a "fake state" and the region as a whole, remains uncertain.

In Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know®, Tim Judah provides a straight-forward guide to the
complicated place that is Kosovo. Judah, who has spent years covering the region, offers succinct,
penetrating answers to a wide range of questions: Why is Kosovo important? Who are the Albanians? Who
are the Serbs? Why is Kosovo so important to Serbs? What role does Kosovo play in the region and in the
world? Judah reveals how things stand now and presents the history and geopolitical dynamics that have led
to it. The most important of these is the question of the right to self-determination, invoked by the Kosovo
Albanians, as opposed to right of territorial integrity invoked by the Serbs. For many Serbs, Kosovo's
declaration of independence and subsequent recognition has been traumatic, a savage blow to national pride.
Albanians, on the other hand, believe their independence rights an historical wrong: the Serbian conquest
(Serbs say "liberation") of Kosovo in 1912.

For anyone wishing to understand both the history and possible future of Kosovo at this pivotal moment in
its history, this book offers a wealth of insight and information in a uniquely accessible format.

What Everyone Needs to Know® is a registered trademark of Oxford University Press.
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From reader reviews:

Blair Kennedy:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know® book is readable by you
who hate the straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable looking at
experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer connected with
Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know® content conveys objective easily to understand by most people.
The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different as it. So , do you nevertheless
thinking Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know® is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Jason Hill:

The ability that you get from Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know® may be the more deep you looking
the information that hide within the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that
this book is hard to recognise but Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know® giving you enjoyment feeling of
reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood through anyone who read
that because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own
personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or
e-book style are available. We propose you for having this Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know®
instantly.

Joan Henderson:

The publication with title Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know® has a lot of information that you can
learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This particular book exist new information the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u
to know how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal
growth. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Eileen Matherly:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Kosovo: What Everyone Needs to Know® can
be the response, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the
others?
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