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The main character Jerusha Abbott was brought up at the John Grier Home, an old-fashioned orphanage. The
children were wholly dependent on charity and had to wear other people's cast-off clothes. Jerusha's unusual
first name was selected by the matron off a gravestone (she hates it and uses "Judy" instead), while her
surname was selected out of the phone book. At the age of 15, she has finished her education and is at loose
ends, still working in the dormitories at the institution where she was brought up. One day, after the asylum's
trustees have made their monthly visit, Judy is informed by the asylum's dour matron that one of the trustees
has offered to pay her way through college. He has spoken to her former teachers and thinks she has
potential to become an excellent writer. He will pay her tuition and also give her a generous monthly
allowance. Judy must write him a monthly letter, because he believes that letter-writing is important to the
development of a writer. However, she will never know his identity; she must address the letters to Mr. John
Smith, and he will never reply. Jerusha catches a glimpse of the shadow of her benefactor from the back, and
knows he is a tall long-legged man. Because of this, she jokingly calls him Daddy-Long-Legs. She attends a
"girls' college" on the East Coast. She illustrates her letters with childlike line drawings, also created by Jean
Webster. The book chronicles Jerusha's educational, personal, and social growth. One of the first things she
does at college is to change her name to "Judy." She designs a rigorous reading program for herself and
struggles to gain the basic cultural knowledge to which she, growing up in the bleak environment of the
orphan asylum, was never exposed. At the end of the book, the identity of 'Daddy-Long-Legs' is revealed as
'Master Jervie,' whom she had met and fallen in love with while she was still unaware that he was 'Daddy-
Long-Legs.'
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From reader reviews:

Samuel Travis:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or
woman? If you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored
faster. And you have free time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to
answer that question due to the fact just their can do that. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every
person. Yes, it is proper. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this specific Daddy-
long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version (Classics To Go) to read.

Jeffery Whitley:

Here thing why this particular Daddy-long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version (Classics To Go) are
different and reputable to be yours. First of all reading a book is good however it depends in the content of it
which is the content is as delightful as food or not. Daddy-long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version
(Classics To Go) giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any e-book out there but
there is no book that similar with Daddy-long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version (Classics To Go). It
gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is
possibly can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even
in your way home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form
of Daddy-long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version (Classics To Go) in e-book can be your alternative.

Robert Harriman:

You may get this Daddy-long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version (Classics To Go) by visit the
bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for
your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only through written or printed but additionally
can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking because of your
mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about
your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try
to choose appropriate ways for you.

Curtis Waters:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many question for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but novel and Daddy-long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version (Classics
To Go) or others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel
desire to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those
guides are helping them to add their knowledge. In different case, beside science reserve, any other book



likes Daddy-long-legs: Revised Edition of Original Version (Classics To Go) to make your spare time far
more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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