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What India's founders derived from Western political traditions as they struggled to free their country from
colonial rule is widely understood. Less well-known is how India's own rich knowledge traditions of two and
a half thousand years influenced these men as they set about constructing a nation in the wake of the Raj. In
Righteous Republic, Ananya Vajpeyi furnishes this missing account, a ground-breaking assessment of
modern Indian political thought.

Taking five of the most important founding figures-Mohandas Gandhi, Rabindranath Tagore, Abanindranath
Tagore, Jawaharlal Nehru, and B. R. Ambedkar-Vajpeyi looks at how each of them turned to classical texts
in order to fashion an original sense of Indian selfhood. The diverse sources in which these leaders and
thinkers immersed themselves included Buddhist literature, the Bhagavad Gita, Sanskrit poetry, the edicts of
Emperor Ashoka, and the artistic and architectural achievements of the Mughal Empire. India's founders
went to these sources not to recuperate old philosophical frameworks but to invent new ones. In Righteous
Republic, a portrait emerges of a group of innovative, synthetic, and cosmopolitan thinkers who succeeded in
braiding together two Indian knowledge traditions, the one political and concerned with social questions, the
other religious and oriented toward transcendence.

Within their vast intellectual, aesthetic, and moral inheritance, the founders searched for different aspects of
the self that would allow India to come into its own as a modern nation-state. The new republic they
envisaged would embody both India's struggle for sovereignty and its quest for the self.
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From reader reviews:

Kenny Grant:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information mainly because book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you studying a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Righteous
Republic: The Political Foundations of Modern India, you can tells your family, friends as well as soon about
yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a guide.

Roxanne Pineda:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get great deal of
stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
yes. People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are there when the spare
time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading guides. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the book you have read will
be Righteous Republic: The Political Foundations of Modern India.

Francisco Garcia:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will
see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to you
personally is Righteous Republic: The Political Foundations of Modern India this book consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how do the world has
grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made
some research when he makes this book. Here is why this book acceptable all of you.

Elizabeth Villalobos:

As we know that book is important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This e-book Righteous Republic: The Political Foundations of Modern India was filled with
regards to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.
Some people has various feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a
book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book
you wanted.
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