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The Red Notebook brings together in one volume all of Paul Auster's short, true-life stories?a
remarkable collection of tales that documents the curious, miraculous, and sometimes catastrophic
turns of everyday reality.

Paul Auster has earned international praise for the imaginative power of his many novels, including The New
York Trilogy, Moon Palace, The Music of Chance, Mr. Vertigo, and Timbuktu. He has also published a
number of highly original non-fiction works: The Invention of Solitude, Hand to Mouth, and The Art of
Hunger. In The Red Notebook, Auster again explores events from the real world large and small, tragic and
comic?that reveal the unpredictable, shifting nature of human experience. A burnt onion pie, a wrong
number, a young boy struck by lightning, a man falling off a roof, a scrap of paper discovered in a Paris hotel
room?all these form the context for a singular kind of ars poetica, a literary manifesto without theory, cast in
the irreducible forms of pure story telling.
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From reader reviews:

Geraldine Schrader:

The event that you get from The Red Notebook: True Stories may be the more deep you searching the
information that hide inside words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book
is hard to understand but The Red Notebook: True Stories giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The
writer conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the
author of this guide is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your current vocabulary increase
well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We recommend you for having this kind of The Red Notebook: True Stories instantly.

Chad Wood:

Typically the book The Red Notebook: True Stories has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book
you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes some
research just before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
reading this article book.

Nicholas Riley:

The Red Notebook: True Stories can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. All of us
recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in
words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article author
giving his/her effort to set every word into joy arrangement in writing The Red Notebook: True Stories
however doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource
details that maybe you can be one of it. This great information may drawn you into new stage of crucial
contemplating.

Wanda Collins:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is The Red Notebook: True Stories this e-book consist a lot of the information on the
condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The dialect styles
that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some analysis when he
makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.
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