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Teaching English as a second or foreign language is full of challenges: How do you hold students' interest?
How do you ensure that they get enough practice to really learn? Teaching young learners--children--
presents unique challenges. Teachers are often looking for age- and level-appropriate activities.

This book presents ideas and techniques appropriate for young learners, divided into sections for
Vocabulary; TPR, Songs, and Chants; Flashcards; Grammar; Combination Activities; and Holidays. Several
of the activities are illustrated with photographs from the instructor's own classroom.

The Fifty Ways to Teach series gives you a variety of drills, games, techniques, methods, and ideas to help
your students learn English. Many require little to no preparation or special materials. The ideas can be used
with any textbook, or without a textbook at all. These short, practical guides aim to make your teaching life
easier, and your students' lives more rewarding and successful.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Poston:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a book
can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this Fifty Ways to Teach Young Learners: Tips
for ESL/EFL Teachers book as this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in this book
hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Benjamin Holmes:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill
your own free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book can be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to try look for book,
may be the guide untitled Fifty Ways to Teach Young Learners: Tips for ESL/EFL Teachers can be excellent
book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

John Malcolm:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Fifty Ways to Teach Young Learners: Tips for ESL/EFL Teachers
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside
or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct
you to pick up this book.

Lawrence Wilson:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Fifty Ways to
Teach Young Learners: Tips for ESL/EFL Teachers which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out
this book? Let's see.
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